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05-05018-01 – Case Fruit Cocktail, 6/10 
Sysco  $49.87 LOW BID 
Robbins  $57.50 
 
05-05020-01 - 
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05-06829-01 - Case Noodles, LaSagne; Whole Wheat 10# Box NO BID 
 
05-06900-01 - Case Sauce, Barbecue, 4/1 Gallon, Smoky 
Sysco  $53.69 LOW BID 
 
05-06920-01 - Gallon Browning Agent, 12/32oz 
Sysco  $84.77 LOW BID 
 
05-06930-01 - Case Sauce, Worcestershire, 1 Gallon 
Sysco  $26.91 LOW BID 
 
05-06930-01-  Case     Sauce, Soy , Low Sodium 1 Gallon NO BID 
 
05-06950-01-  Case     Sauce, Barbecue, 100/1 oz Cup 
Sysco  $13.02 LOW BID  
 
05-07000-01 - Bag Flour, All Purpose, Enriched, 25# Bag 
Sysco   $10.17 LOW BID 
 
05-07010-01 - Case Baking Powder, 5#/8 Per Case 
Sysco  $32.79 LOW BID 
 
05-07014-01 - Case Corn Starch, 24/1# 
Sysco  $20.80 LOW BID 
05-07020-01 - Bag Cornmeal, Yellow, Enriched, 25# Bag 
Sysco  $9.21 LOW BID 
 
05-07040-01 – Bag Rice, Long Grain, Parboil, 25# Bag 
Sysco  $14.15 LOW BID 
 
05-07041-01 – Bag Rice, Brown Parboil 25# 
Sysco  $14.21 LOW BID 
 
05-07050-01 – Case     Baking Soda 12/2 Ib. 
Sysco  $18.30 LOW BID 
 
05-07060-01 -  Case     Sugar, Light Brown, 24/1# 
Sysco  $26.48 LOW BID 
 
05-07065-01 - Case Sugar, Powdered, 24/1# Packer Label 
Sysco  $29.73 LOW BID 
 
05-07070-01 – Case  Sugar, Granulated, Fine Cane, 25# Bag 
Sysco  $21.06 LOW BID  
 
05-07080-01 - Case Syrup,Corn, Light, 4/1 Gallon 
Sysco $27.21 LOW BID 
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05-07081-01 -  Case     Syrup, Imitation Maple, Individually Packaged 100/1.5 NO BID 
 
05-07170-01 -  Case Shortening, Liquid 35# 0 Trans 
Sysco  $41.97 LOW BID  
 
05-07250-01 - Case Yeast, Instant, Dry, Vacuum Packed, 20 Count 
Sysco  $53.12 LOW BID 
 
05-07257-01 - Each Red Food Coloring, 1 Pint 
Sysco  $41.13 LOW BID 
 
05-07258-01 – Each Paprika, 1# NO BID 
 
05-07262-01 – Each Italian Seasoning, 6.5 Oz NO BID 
 
05-07267-01 – Each Parsley Flakes, 2 Oz NO BID 
  
05-07270-01 - Each Lemon Pepper, 23 Oz NO BID 
 
05-07271-01 – Each Onion Powder, 20 Oz 
Sysco  $7.63 LOW BID 
 
05-07272-01 - Each Green Food Coloring, 1 Pint NO BID 
 
05-07273-01 -  Each Sage, 6 Oz, Ground NO BID 
 
05-07277-01 – Case All Purpose Seasoning (Salt-Free) 4/20 Oz NO BID 
 
05-07300-01 – Case Cheese Sauce 6/10 
Sysco   $41.15 LOW BID  
 
05-07350-01 – Case Pan Spray 6/17 oz. 
Sysco  24.11 LOW BID 
 
05-07263-01 – Case Southwest Blend Seasoning or Mexican (Salt-Free) 5# NO BID 
 
05-07265-01 – Case Creole Blend Seasoning (Salt-Free) 5# NO BID 
 
05-05710-01 -  Case Chilli Powder NO BID 
 
05-02715-01 -  Case Chili Seasoning Mix 6/13 oz 
Sysco  $32.89 LOW BID 
 
05-06700-01 -  Case      Rotini Pasta 20# 
Sysco  $25.62 LOW BID 
 
05-05425-01 -  Case Chicken Salad, Lunch On The Run 4/8.2 oz NO BID 
 
05-05426-01 -  Case      Tuna Salad, Lunch On The Run 4/8.2 oz NO BID 
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05-05424-01 -  Case Chipotle Chicken Salad, Snack On The Run Kit 12/3.5 NO BID 
 
05-05428-01 -  Case BBQ Chicken , Snack On The Run Kit 12/3.5 NO BID 
 
05-05429-01 -  Case      Tuna Salad, Snack On The Run Kit 12/3.5 NO BID 
 
 
 
Bid 3198 (12-21-21) – Food Service Warehouse Paper & Stock Supplies 
Source of Funds:  2110-900-3100-000-600-525 
Effective Dates: February 15, 2022 – June 30, 2022  
Recommendation: Chris Rogers/Al Young 
 

 Vendor Location Abbreviation 
N Hotel & Restaurant Supply Jackson, MS Hotel 

N Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NY Interboro 

N Imperial Dade Loxley, AL Imperial 

M Daxwell Houston, TX Daxwell 

N Durable Packaging Wheeling, IL Durable 

N Sysco Jackson Jackson, MS Sysco 

 
 

Paper Products 
 
05-03000-01 Bags, Brown, Lunch, 5#, 500/Package 
Imperial $12.72 LOW BID 
Sysco  $15.79 
 
05-03001-01 Bags, Saddle Packing Dispensing 6.5”X7 Flip-Lock Top 2000CT 
Imperial $9.65 LOW BID 
Interboro $11.34 
 
05-03005-01 Bowl, Salad, Round Foam, Disposable, White, 1000/Case or 1250/case 
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05-03025-01 Cup, Clear Plastic Portion Rolled Rim, 4 Oz, Round, 2500/Case 
Imperial $50.77 LOW BID 
Daxwell  $65.52 
 
05-03026-01 Lid, Clear Plastic for Rolled Rim Cup, 4 Oz, Round, 2500/Case 
Imperial $32.31 LOW BID 
Daxwell  $58.01 
 
05-03030-01 Tray, Three Compartment, With Lid, Disposable, 8 7/8" X 9 1/4", 200/Case 
Sysco  $25.14 LOW BID 
Imperial  $35.90 
 
05-03040-01 Tray, School Lunch, Six Compartment, Disposable, White, 500/Case 
Imperial $31.50 LOW BID 
 
05-03050-01 Tray, Breakfast, Disposable, 8.7” X 6.1”, 1000/Case or 800/Case 
Imperial $28.92 LOW BID 
 
05-03060-01 Foil, Aluminum, 18" Wide X 500 Foot Roll, Heavy-Duty Gauge 
Imperial $30.43 LOW BID 
Sysco  $30.54 
Daxwell  $35.65 
Durable  $43.99 
 
05-03070-01 Wrap, Food, Polyethylene, 18” X 2000 Foot Roll, .0005 Gauge 
Daxwell $15.66 LOW BID 
Imperial  $16.85 
Durable  $21.94 
 
05-03081-01 Ind. Wrapped Fork, Plastic, Medium, White, 1000/Case  
Imperial $13.75 LOW BID 
Daxwell  $17.95 
Sysco  $100.20 
 
05-03090-01 Liner, Bun Pan, 16 3/8" X 24 3/8", 1000/Box 
Imperial $34.00 LOW BID 
Sysco  $57.86 
Durable  $63.95 
 
05-03100-01 Napkins, Dispenser, 10,000/Case 7.5 x 13.5 
Imperial $24.74 LOW BID 
Daxwell  $49.21 
 
05-03121-01 Ind. Wrapped Spoons, Plastic, Medium, White, 1000/Case 
Imperial $11.29 LOW BID 
Daxwell  $17.95 
Sysco  $25.72 
 
05-03130-01 Bowls, Soup, Disposable, 1000/Case/12 ounce 
Imperial $21.34 LOW BID 
Sysco  $34.18 
 
05-03190-01 Tray, 6X6 Hinged Container 18 
Imperial $99.48 LOW BID 
 
 
 








