JACKSON PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Jackson, Mississippi Date: July 18, 2018

Board of Trustees Jackson Public School District Jackson, Mississippi

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Presented for your review on the attached page(s) are the bid tabulations for the formal bid proposals which were received in response to the bid solicitations indicated below. Bids were publicly advertised and opened according to all legal requirements (Mississippi Code of 1972, §31-7-13). All bids were tabulated, analyzed and based upon compliance with the specifications; the "lowest and best" bids were determined. Recommendations concerning the award of bids received for each bid category are contained on the attached page(s). Please consider recommendations for the following:

Bid	Opening	Bid Name	
Number	Date		
Bid 3078	06-15-18	Food Service Furniture and Equipment	
Bid 3079	07-12-18	Food Service Frozen Food, Meat Products, Crackers &	
		Chips	

It is recommended that the following action be taken by the Board of Trustees:

- A. **AN ORDER** be adopted ratifying the prior solicitation of bid proposals for the equipment, supplies, commodities and/or services in each bid category indicated above.
- B. **AN ORDER** be adopted authorizing the Chief Financial Officer or her designee to issue purchase orders and/or execute contracts and all related documents on behalf of the Board of Trustees to the vendors deemed to have submitted the "lowest and best" bids as indicated on the attached pages.
- C. **AN ORDER** be adopted to reject the bid of bidders who failed to comply with bid requirements, for the reason(s) indicated with each bid category, on the attached pages.
- D. **AN ORDER** be adopted to authorize the informal purchase of items according to all legal requirements and to the extent allowed under the law (Mississippi Code 1972, Annotated, §31-7-13(b)) for which no formal bids were received as indicated in the detailed support documentation on file in the Business Office.

Submitted by: Sharolyn Miller Chief Financial Officer

Recommendation approved by:

Dr. Fr

Information about the Content and Formatting of the Attached Bid Tabulation Sheet(s)

Pursuant to the legal requirements as outlined in the Mississippi Code 1972, Annotated, §31-7-13(d), all bid proposals received were compared to the written bid specifications and the recommendation to purchase or for rejection is indicated on the following pages, as per the manner prescribed below.

Recommendation to Purchase:

The recommendation to purchase from or award a contract to any vendor, is indicated on the attached tabulation sheet(s) by placing "Low Bid" to the right of the vendor's name/pricing and bolding the information.

Rejection of an Item or an Entire Bid:

The law requires that the District clearly state why in each instance that the lowest bid received is not the recommended "lowest and <u>best</u>" bid. The specific reason that an item or service, or a vendor's entire bid proposal, must be deemed "irregular" or "noncompliant" with the written bid specifications and therefore cannot be recommended for purchase, is indicated on the attached tabulation sheet(s) by drawing a line through the vendor's name/pricing and indicating the rejection reason beside the item.

Unit Price Differences Between the Lowest and the "Lowest and Best" Bid:

The unit price of all items is indicated and a difference between the bid unit price of the proposed item being rejected and the unit price of the item being recommended for purchase as the "lowest and best" can easily be computed from the data on the following pages. For each item, please see the attached tabulation sheet(s) for the bid name and number and opening date, item description, unit of measure, quantity purchased, and the unit or total pricing submitted by all vendors offering bid proposals.

Minority Vendor Participation in the Bid Process:

At the direction of the Board, all minority and women owned and operated vendors offering bid proposals are identified on the attached tabulation sheets, for informational purposes only. The following coding has been used:

- "M" Minority (Male) owned and operated business
- "W" Women (Non-minority) owned and operated business
- "B" Minority (Women) owned and operated business
- "N" Non-Minority owned and operated business

Bid 3078 (06-15-2018) – Food Service Furniture and Equipment

Source of Funds: 2110-900-3162-000-730-001

Recommendation Per: Mary Hill

	Vendor	Location	Abbreviation
Ν	Hotel Restaurant & Supply	Jackson, MS	Hotel
Ν	Associated Food Equipment & Supplies	Gulfport, MS	Associated
N	Alack Refrigeration Co, Inc	Hammond, LA	Alack
Ν	BHS Food Service Solutions, LLC	Amherst, NY	BHS

ITEM 1 THREE SECTION REACH-IN REFRIGERATOR

Hotel\$3749.00Associated\$3750.00Alack\$4293.00BHS\$5191.14

ITEM 2 TWO SECTION REACH-IN FREEZER

Hotel \$3699.00 Associated \$3725.00

TWO SECTION REAC-IN FREEZER

Associated \$10,000.00 BHS \$15,595.77

ITEM 7 DISH WASHER HOBART, MODEL CL44e

Hotel\$22,100.00Alack\$25,639.00BHS\$26,394.70Associated\$37,000.00

ITEM 8A DISH WASHER HOBART, MODEL CLPS66eN-BAS

Hotel\$34,998.00Associated\$35,000.00Alack\$36,013.00BHS\$38,262.62

ITEM 8B DISH WASHER HOBART, MODEL CLPS66eN-BAS Item Not Selected

 Hotel
 \$34,998.00

 Associated
 \$35,000.00

 Alack
 \$37,614.00

 BHS
 \$40,221.31

ITEM 9 GAS CONVECTION STEAMER CLEVELAND, MODEL 36-CGM-16-300

Hotel\$22,249.00Associated\$22,250.00Alack\$23,543.00BHS\$28,692.60

ITEM 10 CONVECTION STEAMER, GAS CLEVELAND MODEL 24-CGM-200

Hotel\$16,799.00Associated\$16,800.00Alack\$17,451.00BHS\$22,374.20

ITEM 11 STEAM JACKETED KETTLE, CLEVELAND MODEL KDM-25-T, 25

GALLON

Hotel\$13,999.00Associated\$14,250.00Alack\$14,999.00BHS\$18,003.70

BID 3079 (07/12/18) - Food Service Frozen Food, Meat Products, Crackers & Chips

Effective Dates: August 1, 2018 – December 31, 2018

With Option to Extend One (1) additional Seven (7) Months Including Summer Feeding

Program

Source of Funds: 2110-900-3100-000-600-625 and 2110-900-3162-000-641-(School Code)

Recommendation Per: Mary Hill/Cagney Brown

	Vendor	Location	Abbreviation
Ν	Kent Quality Foods	Grand Rapids, MI	Kent
N	Sysco of Jackson	Jackson, MS	Sysco Sysco

Group I - Breakfast Products - Juice, Pastry, and Related Products - Items 1-41

Kent No Bid **Sysco \$764,176.05**

Group II - Beef and Pork Products – Items 1-19

Kent \$21,960.00 Quoted on Items 12 Only

Sysco \$485,883.35

Group III - Poultry and Fish Products – Items 1-29

Kent No Bid

Sysco \$738,926.59

Group IV - Vegetables and Pizza Products/Miscellaneous – Items 1-51

Kent No Bid **Sysco \$945,890.23**

Group V - Cracker and Chips - Items 1-20

Kent No Bid

Sysco \$300,149.65